



DATE - April 27, 2016

BID - Motor Oils & Lubricants

Purchasing Department  
 125 N. Division St. # 205  
 Salisbury, MD 21801  
 Phone: 410-548-4805  
 Fax: 410-334-3130

## Bid Tabulation

Company Name:	R.C. Holloway		REIT Lubricants	
<b><u>BULK QUANTITIES</u></b>	<b><u>Brand</u></b>	<b><u>Price Per Gallon</u></b>	<b><u>Brand</u></b>	<b><u>Price Per Gallon</u></b>
15W-40 Engine Oil,API CG4 - CF4 CFCE - CD11 CD/SH SG – CJ4 – CI4	NO BID	NO BID	CHEVRON URSA SUPER PLUS	\$6.04
5W-30 Engine Oil – GF5/CE SM	NO BID	NO BID	CHEVRON SUPREME	\$4.66
Automatic Transmission Fluid – Dextron 6	NO BID	NO BID	SHEVRON HAVOLINE SYN MV ATF	\$9.86
Universal Hydraulic Tractor Oil	NO BID	NO BID	CHEVRON 10000 THF	\$6.31
<b><u>55 GAL DRUMS (Est. 5 Drums each)</u></b>	<b><u>Brand</u></b>	<b><u>Price Per Drum</u></b>	<b><u>Brand</u></b>	<b><u>Price Per Drum</u></b>
Trans. Fluid Drive Train Oil HD 50 – T04 Spec	GULF	\$647.52	CHEVRON TORQUE FORCE 50	\$654.82
All Purpose Gear Lubricant 85W-140	SUPER S	\$555.36	CHEVRON MULTIGEAR EP-5	\$678.24
All Purpose Gear Lubricant 80W90	SUPER S	\$555.36	CHEVRON MULTIGEAR EP-5	\$678.24
Motor Oil P70 Spec 50W CD 11 CD/SG	SUPER S	\$596.40	CHEVRON URSA SUPER PLUS	\$716.14
Motor Oil 10W CG4/CF4/CF	SUPER S	\$596.40	CHEVRON URSA HYD 10	\$705.09
Multi Purpose Chassis Grease EP2	CASTROL	\$1,573.36	CHEVRON MULTIFAK EP 2	\$876.47
HD 46 Hydraulic Oil	GULF	\$328.02	CHEVRON HYDRAULIC OIL AW	\$226.19
5W20 Engine Oil – GF5	GULF	\$367.78	CHEVRON SUPREME	\$278.44
Automatic Transmission Fluid -Mercon 5	SUPER S	\$623.38	CHEVRON HAVOLINE SYN MV ATF	\$564.44
Rotella T6 HD SAE5W40	SHELL ROTELLA	\$1,476.80	CHEVRON DELO 400 LE SYNTHETIC	\$1,547.12
Dextron V1 Transmission Fluid	CAM 2	\$623.38	CHEVRON HAVOLINE SYN MV ATF	\$564.44
Diesel Exhaust Fluid	VARIES	\$170.40	ULTRAPURE DEF	\$140.94
<b><u>CASE LOTS (EST. 50 CASES)</u></b>	<b><u>Brand</u></b>	<b><u>Price Per Case</u></b>	<b><u>Brand</u></b>	<b><u>Price Per Case</u></b>
15w-40 Engine Oil – CJ4 (Quarts)	CAM 2	\$29.82	CHEVRON DELO 400 LE 15W40	\$33.46 cs- 12 qts
10W-30 Engine Oil – GF5 SM (Quarts)	CAM 2	\$24.20	CHEVRON SUPREME	\$25.31 cs- 12 qts
Auto Transmission Fluid ATF+4 Chrysler Recommended (Quarts)	CAM 2	\$42.77	CHEVRON HAVOLINE ATF +4	\$58.52 cs- 12 qts
Multi Purpose Chassis Grease EP2 (Tubes)	SUPER S	\$32.23	CHEVRON MULTIFAK EP 2	\$83.69 cs- 40 tubes
5W20 Engine Oil	SUPER S	\$23.00	CHEVRON SUPREME	\$25.31 cs- 12 qts
<b><u>SYNTHETICS: 55 GALLON DRUM</u></b>	<b><u>Brand</u></b>	<b><u>Price Per Drum</u></b>	<b><u>Brand</u></b>	<b><u>Price Per Drum</u></b>
TL 50 Transmission Oil	GULF	\$1,300.72	CHEVRON DELO SYN-TRANS HD	\$1,430.59
75W90 Gear Lubricant	GULF	\$1,175.76	CHEVRON DELO SYN-GEAR XDM	\$1,304.56
SHC 634 Synthetic	NO BID	N/A	CHEVRON CETUS HYPERSYN 460	\$1,521.24
Mercon-V ATF Synthetic Blend	CAM 2	\$623.38	CHEVRON HAVOLINE SYN MV ATF	\$564.44