



## Janitorial Supplies for Detention Center Bid Tabulation

Company Name	60" Broom, Fiberglass Handle	Enzyme D	Black Tampico Brush	Bi-Level Deck Scrub	Brown Scrub N Strip Pads	32 oz. Bottles	Super Scope II	Brute Container 20 Gal	Brute Container 32 Gal	Rectangle Waste Basket	Any Exceptions?
Central Poly Bag Corp	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Yes
SuperClean Janitorial	\$9.95	No Bid	\$12.28	No Bid	No Bid	\$24.13	No Bid	\$25.00	\$29.68	No Bid	Yes
Source Supply Company	\$10.35	\$37.75	\$9.75	\$6.95	\$16.95	\$15.60	\$55.50	\$17.95	\$21.95	\$12.75	Yes
Interboro Packaging Corporation Bid A	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Yes
Interboro Packaging Corporation Bid B	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Yes
Interboro Packaging Corporation Bid C	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Yes
Interboro Packaging Corporation Bid D	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Yes
United Sales USA Corp	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Yes
All American Poly	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No
Unipak	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No
Calico	\$61.24	\$26.94	\$74.54	\$32.74	\$11.84	\$10.34	\$19.54	\$12.48	\$14.48	\$5.94	Yes
Rudolph's Office and Computer Supply	\$8.75	\$35.96	\$10.25	\$11.91	\$42.27	\$13.91	\$61.87	\$22.53	\$28.08	\$4.74	No
Holt Paper and Chemical	\$4.60	\$35.38	\$77.76	\$41.94	\$3.10	\$9.60	no bid	\$12.49	\$15.16	\$9.04	No
BISM	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	0.75 each	\$98.45	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Yes
Apparent low bid											

Purchasing Department  
 125 N. Division St. # 205  
 Salisbury, MD 21801  
 Phone: 410-548-4805  
 Fax: 410-334-3130